

**RAPPAHANNOCK REGIONAL JAIL  
PROCUREMENT OFFICE  
PO Box 3300  
Stafford, VA 22555  
Phone: (540) 288-5273 Fax: (540) 288-0819**

**NOTICE OF CONTRACT AWARD**

**DATE:** June 04, 2021  
**COMMODITY NAME:** Janitorial Supplies  
**CONTRACT NUMBER:** 2021-JS  
**CONTRACT PERIOD:** July 1, 2021– June 30, 2022  
**RENEWAL OPTIONS:** Four (4) one-year renewal options

**CONTRACTOR(s): Page 1 of 2**

Abel Industries, Inc  
16815 Interstate Dr.  
Dumfries, VA 22026

Mark Unroe  
P: 703-385-0096  
F: 703-385-0096  
[maunroe@abelsupply.com](mailto:maunroe@abelsupply.com)

Pyramid School Products  
6510 N 54<sup>th</sup> Street  
Tampa, FL 33610

Kenneth Miller  
P: 800-792-2644 ext. 225  
F: 813-621-7688  
[biddept@pyramidsp.com](mailto:biddept@pyramidsp.com)

The Supply Room Co  
14140 North Washington Hwy.  
Ashland, VA 23005

David Fritter  
P: 804-412-2750  
C: 804-541-4302  
[dfritter@lawrence-environmental.com](mailto:dfritter@lawrence-environmental.com)

Brame Specialty Company, Inc.  
1222 Rhodes Ave  
Roanoke, VA 24024

Lee H. Hathaway  
P: 919-598-1500  
F: 919-598-5623  
[roanoke@bramespecialty.com](mailto:roanoke@bramespecialty.com)

Acuity Specialty Products, Inc.  
Db a Zep Sales & Service  
3330 Cumberland Blvd., Suite 700  
Atlanta, GA 30339

Maureena Fabien-Watson  
P: 877-428-9937  
F: 866-393-7329  
[zepbids@zep.com](mailto:zepbids@zep.com)

**RAPPAHANNOCK REGIONAL JAIL  
PROCUREMENT OFFICE  
PO Box 3300  
Stafford, VA 22555  
Phone: (540) 288-5273 Fax: (540) 288-0819**

**NOTICE OF CONTRACT AWARD**

**DATE:** June 04, 2021  
**COMMODITY NAME:** Janitorial Supplies  
**CONTRACT NUMBER:** 2021-JS  
**CONTRACT PERIOD:** July 1, 2021– June 30, 2022  
**RENEWAL OPTIONS:** Four (4) one-year renewal options

**CONTRACTOR(s): Page 2 of 2**

Global Chi Supply Solutions, LLC  
41 Peabody Street  
Nashville, TN 37210  
Lindsey Conrad  
P: 920-581-5003  
F: 615-551-5202  
[sales@globalchi.com](mailto:sales@globalchi.com)

Crown Linen Services, Inc.  
Dbas Loyal Hygiene Services  
8709 Quarry Road  
Manassas, VA 20110  
Sheri L. Howard  
P: 703-361-7888  
F: 703-361-1879  
[showard@4loyal.com](mailto:showard@4loyal.com)

**TERMS:** Net 45 days  
**DELIVERY:** See Section 3.0 Delivery ITB #2021-JS

**FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT:**  
Lisa Walker  
Procurement Officer  
540-288-5273

*AWARDED ITEMS  
BY VENDOR  
HIGHLIGHTED IN  
BID TABULATION*

RAPPAHANNOCK REGIONAL JAIL ITB NO. #2021-JS

<b>BID TAB</b>							TSRC, Inc.	Abel Industries, Inc.	Brame Specialty Company	Interboro Packaging Corp	Calico Packaging, LLC	ZEP Home Office-Admin	Central Poly-Bag Corp	Global Chi Supply Solution, LLC	Pyramid Paper Company	Loyal Hygiene Service
<b>BROOMS, BRUSHES, DUSTERS CATEGORY</b>																
	Estimated Annual Quantity	Unit	Item	Specifics	AWARDED Item Code	Price										
1.	48	Each	PALMYRA PUSH BROOM	24" PALMYRA PUSH BROOM 12/CS (THREADED HANDLE SOLD SEPARATELY)	Better Brush #120224	EACH	11.35 ea	7.88 ea	18.91 ea	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	8.76 ea	5.99 ea	no bid
2.	24	Each	SCRUB BRUSH	ABCO IRON HANDLE SCRUB BRUSH 12/CS	1590228	EACH	3.33 ea	1.65 ea	.96 ea	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	2.11 ea	.98 ea	no bid
3.	10	Case	BLACK HEAVY DUTY DOODLE PAD	4.5X10 5/PK 4PK/CS (FOR DUTY PAD HOLDER)	ACS #672	EACH	1.07 ea	1.31	.79 ea	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	0.55	no bid
4.	110	Each	MAID CORN BROOM/EA	42" WOODEN HANDLE	1570000	EACH	7.20 ea	5.06 ea	3.33 ea	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	6.12 ea	3.99 ea	no bid
5.	20	Each	POLY MULTI LEVEL BRUSH	POLYPROPYLENE BRUSH (HANDLE SOLD SEPARATELY)	Rubbermaid #FG6337BL	EACH	9.95 ea	8.75 ea	6.86 ea	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	6.05 ea	no bid
6.	24	Each	COUNTER BRUSH	O'DELL COUNTER BRUSH	ABCO #00100	EACH	8.48 ea	3.49 ea	4.14 ea	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	6.35 ea	1.99 ea	no bid
7.	100	Each	SWIVEL SNAP WOOD 60'	HANDLE FOR DUST MOP FRAMES EA	ABCO #01406NB	EACH	9.15 ea	5.92 ea	9.05 ea	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	13.14 ea	4.39 ea	no bid
8.	25	Case	SCRUB-N-STRIP BRN 20/CS	BRN 20/CS	AM0541010	CASE	2.20 cs	12.79 cs	15.75 ea	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	10.97 cs	no bid
9.	10	Case	SCOUR PADS GREEN 60/C	GREEN 60/CS	ACS #S095	CASE	19.58 cs	13.23 cs	18.36	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	15.84 cs	9.98 cs	no bid

Rappahannock Regional Jail ITB NO. #2021-JS

**BID TAB**

**CLEANING TOOLS CATEGORY**

CLEANING TOOLS CATEGORY							TSRC, Inc.	Abel Industries, Inc.	Brame Specialty Company	Interboro Packaging Corp	Calico Packaging, LLC	ZEP Home Office-Admin	Central Poly Bag Corp	Global Chi Supply Solution, LLC	Pyramid Paper Company	Loyal Hygiene Service
	Estimated Annual Quantity	Unit	Item	Specifics	AWARDED Item Code	Price										
1.	24	Each	IMPACT E-Z FILL	5 GALLON CONTAINER	Impact #7576	EACH	15.86 ea	14.98 ea	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	12.56 ea	11.98 ea	no bid
2.	95	Each	SUPER JAWS YELLOW HNDLE 60"	WET MOP WOOD HANDLE 60" LONG	ABCO #01207NB	EACH	13.25 ea	5.98 ea	20.11 ea	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	8.04 ea	4.79 ea	6.40 ea
3.	535	Each	32 OZ SPRAY HEAD/EA	TO FIT SPRAY BOTTLE BELOW	Impact #4902	EACH	0.96 ea	.73 ea	no bid	no bid	no bid	1.80 ea	no bid	.64 ea	.59 ea	.68 ea
4.	150	Each	32OZ SPRAY BOTTLE ONLY/EA	CLEAR	Not Provided with Bid	EACH	.92 ea	.61 ea	no bid	no bid	no bid	.80 ea	no bid	.50 ea	.58 ea	.72 ea
5.	50	Each	12" BLACK PLASTIC DUST PAN	(NO HANDLE JUST DUST PAN – plastic only)	2150500	EACH	5.52 ea	1.94 ea	1.60 ea	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	2.46 ea	1.89 ea	no bid
6.	35	Case	20" BLACK STRIPPING PAD 5/CS	STRIPPING PAD 5/CS	ACS #70-20	CASE	20.50 cs	14.82 cs	15.41 cs	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	16.44 cs	11.19 cs	no bid
7.	125	Case	20" CHAMPAGNE HS BUFFING 5/CS	FLOOR PAD5/CS	ACS #42-20	CASE	19.95 cs	14.65 cs	15.72 cs	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	11.19 cs	no bid
8.	175	Case	20" WHITE POLISHING PAD 5/CS	FLOOR PAD 5/CS	ACS #41-20	CASE	29.73 cs	14.82 cs	15.41 cs	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	16.44 cs	11.19 cs	no bid
9.	2	Unit	Envirox ABSOLUTE CLEANING SYSTEM DISPENSER	<b>No Substitutions</b>	DISPH202ACSSG	UNIT	no bid	0	no bid	no bid	no bid	program not accepted no award	no bid	no bid	no bid	substitution not accepted

Rappahannock Regional Jail ITB NO. #2021-JS

**BID TAB**

**CLEANERS DETERGENTS CATEGORY**

CLEANERS DETERGENTS CATEGORY							TSRC, Inc.	Abel Industries, Inc.	Brame Specialty Company	Interboro Packaging Corp	Calico Packaging, LLC	ZEP Home Office-Admin	Central Poly-Bag Corp	Global Chi Supply Solution, LLC	Pyramid Paper Company	Loyal Hygiene Service
	Estimated Annual Quantity	Unit	Item	Specifics	Item Code	Price										
1.	10	PI	TERMINATOR H.D. MOP/STRIP	FLOOR STRIPPER 5 GALLON PAIL	No item # provide with bid submission	PAIL	49.70 pl	48.98 pl	67.11 pl	no bid	no bid	60.00 pl	no bid	45.17 pl	no bid	no bid
2.	10	PI	ABEL DIAMOND PLUS FINISH5GAL/P	FLOOR FINISH 5 GALLON PAIL	FLRPLAT5	PAIL	86.90 pl	59.98 pl	132.1	no bid	no bid	69.00 pl	no bid	67.72 pl	no bid	no bid
3.	100	Case	Envirox H2Orange2 Hyper-concentrate 112 <b>NO SUBSTITUTIONS</b>	Sanitizer/Virucide Cleaner Gallon Container	CLNH202ACS	PER GALLON	no bid	84.99	no bid	no bid	no bid	substitution not accepted	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
4.	12	Case	Envirox Mineral Shock <b>NO SUBSTITUTIONS</b>	Gallon Container	A-141-02B	CASE	no bid	109.98 cs	no bid	no bid	no bid	substitution not accepted	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
5.	10	Case	PINE-SOL ORIGINAL MULTI-PURPOSE CLEANER	Gallon Container		PER OZ	0.08	0.27	0.16	no bid	no bid	0.12	no bid	0.38	0.31	no bid
6.	40	PI	HURACAN LAUNDRY DETERGENT 40#	POWDERED (40LB)	7907892	PAIL	32.00 pl	22.98 pl	22.05 pl	no bid	no bid	62.99 pl	no bid	45.53 pl	30.98 pl	no bid
7.	20	GI	WINDEX	GALLON	ZEP VUE TRU 101024 4 X 1 GALLON	PER GALLON	6.56	9.8	11.38	no bid	no bid	6.00	no bid	43.73	13.99	32.4

**Rappahannock Regional Jail ITB NO. #2021-JS  
**BID TAB****

**CLEANERS DETERGENTS CATEGORY**

							TSRC, Inc.	Abel Industries, Inc.	Brame Specialty Company	Interboro Packaging Corp	Calico Packaging, LLC	ZEP Home Office-Admin	Central Poly Bag Corp	Global Chi Supply Solution, LLC	Pyramid Paper Company	Loyal Hygiene Service
	Estimated Annual Quantity	Unit	Item	Specifics	Item Code	Price										
8.	40	Gl	DAWN DEGREASER <b>NO SUBSTITUTIONS</b>	DAWN HEAVY DUTY DEGREASER GALLON	PGC04852	GALLON	21.88 gl	19.33	No subs accepted	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	60.30 gl	26.98 gl	33.64
9.	100	Each	CLOROX WIPES	CLOROX WIPES DISINFECTANT 75/CONTAINER	No item # provide with bid submission	PER SHEET	0.07	0.08	0.07	no bid	no bid	0.07	no bid	0.06	0.07	no bid
10.	50	Each	AKTIVE DISINFECTING & CLEANING WET WIPES	500 WIPES 6 BUCKETS PER CASE	6190	PER SHEET	0.12	0.06	0.06	no bid	no bid	0.06	no bid	0.06	no bid	0.03
11.	12	Gl	ZEP Z TREAD	ZEP Z TREAD SPRAY BUFF SOLUTION GAL	1891600	PER GALLON	9.10	48.65	2.58	no bid	no bid	11.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
12.	12	Case	CLOROX 360 <b>NO SUBSTITUTIONS</b>	CLOROX 360 DISINFECTANT CLEANER GALLON 4/CS	CLO31650	CASE	no bid	69.98 cs	90.96 cs	no bid	no bid	substitution not accepted	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
13.	18	Each	PLEDGE <b>NO SUBSTITUTIONS</b>	FURNITURE POLISH AEROSOL	PLEDGE #SIN301168	CASE	no bid	5.75 ea	7.05 ea	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	6.16 ea	4.99 ea	no bid
14.	24	Case	ENVIROX CRITICAL CARE <b>NO SUBSTITUTIONS</b>	ENVIROX CRITICAL CARE DISINFECTANT QUART 6/CASE	CLNH202CRITC	CASE	no bid	49.98 cs	no bid	no bid	no bid	substitution not accepted	no bid	no bid	no bid	substitution not accepted

**Rappahannock Regional Jail ITB NO. #2021-JS**

**BID TAB**

**CLEANERS DETERGENTS CATEGORY**

CLEANERS DETERGENTS CATEGORY							TSRC, Inc.	Abel Industries, Inc.	Brame Specialty Company	Interboro Packaging Corp	Calico Packaging, LLC	ZEP Home Office-Admin	Central Poly-Bag Corp	Global Chi Supply Solution, LLC	Pyramid Paper Company	Loyal Hygiene Service
	Estimated Annual Quantity	Unit	Item	Specifics	Item Code	Price										
15.	12	Gal	DIVERSEY EXTRACTION	CARPET CLEANER GAL 4/CASE	ZEP LEMONGRASS EXTRACT IT 128423	CASE	121.21 cs	61.60 cs	71.32 cs	no bid	no bid	44.00 cs	no bid	179.32	no bid	no bid
16.	24	Gal	BLEACH <b>NO SUBSTITUTIONS</b>	HOUSEHOLD BLEACH GAL 4/CASE	BLEACH6	CASE	17.33 cs	10.80 cs	18.03 cs	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	28.12	no bid	no bid



Rappahannock Regional Jail ITB NO. #2021-JS

**BID TAB**

**MOPS & EQUIPMENT CATEGORY**

MOPS & EQUIPMENT CATEGORY							TSRC, Inc.	Abel Industries, Inc.	Brame Specialty Company	Interboro Packaging Corp	Calico Packaging, LLC	ZEP Home Office-Admin	Central Poly-Bag Corp	Global Chi Supply Solution, LLC	Pyramid Paper Company	Loyal Hygiene Service
	Estimated Annual Quantity	Unit	Item	Specifics	AWARDED Item Code	Price										
1.	75	Each	24X5 LAUNDERABLE DSTMOPHD/EA	DSTMOPHD/EA (FITS ON THE DSTF241)	ABCO #DMTL12524DBL	EACH	9.98 ea	7.25 ea	5.17 ea	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	4.21 ea	3.99 ea	no bid
2.	20	Each	TAPERED WOODEN HANDLE 54"/EA	54"/EA (FIT THE BRM24G & BRM24M BROOM HEADS)	ABCO #01112	EACH	4.75 ea	3.25 ea	3.44 ea	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	2.39 ea	no bid
3.	125	Each	THREADED WOODEN HANDLE	HANDLE EA	ABCO #01102	EACH	2.95 ea	2.98 ea	3.63 ea	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	2.29 ea	no bid
4.	10	Case	LARGE COTTON LOOPED MOP HEAD	WET MOP HEAD	ABCO #CLM303LWB	EACH	4.96	6.02	4.05	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	16.18 ea	3.99	9.95 ea
5.	24	Each	GREEN MOP HEADS	MICROFIBER TUBE MOP 14OZ	MONARCH #M600014G	EACH	no bid	5.99 ea	8.53 ea	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	14.45 ea	5.59 ea	no bid
6.	5	Each	C- HC CUBE TRUCK 16 CUBE BLACK	Rubbermaid	2590005	EACH	no bid	525.00 ea	464.38 ea	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	629.95	no bid
7.	24	Each	SQUEEGEE	24" SQUEEGEE (TAPERED HANDLE NOT INCLUDED)	ABCO BH14002	EACH	19.65 ea	26.51 ea	28.69	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	32.12 ea	6.99 ea	no bid

**Rappahannock Regional Jail ITB NO. #2021-JS**

**BID TAB**

**GLOVES CATEGORY**

							TSRC, Inc.	Abel Industries, Inc.	Brame Specialty Company	Interboro Packaging Corp	Calico Packaging, LLC	ZEP Home Office-Admin	Central Poly-Bag Corp	Global Chi Supply Solution, LLC	Pyramid Paper Company	Loyal Hygiene Service
	Estimated Annual Quantity	Unit	Item	Specifics	AWARDED Item Code	Price										
1.	45	m/case	VINYL POWDERFREE 6.1 MIL 899-4	6.1 MIL 899-4 X-TRA LARGE GLOVES 100 GLOVES/BOX 10BOX/CASE	7710	CASW	160.00 cs	68.97 cs	no bid	72.00 cs	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	89.90 cs	63.75 cs
2.	45	m/case	VINYL POWDERFREE 6.1 MIL 899-4	6.1 MIL 899-4 X-TRA XLARGE GLOVES 100 GLOVES/BOX 10BOX CASE	7712	CASW	160.00 cs	68.97 cs	no bid	72.00 cs	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	89.90 cs	63.75 cs
3.	45	m/case	NITRILE POWDERFREE GLOVES 5MIL	NITRILE EXAMINATION GLOVES SMALL GLOVES 100 GLOVES/BOX 10 BOX/CASE	No item # provided with bid submission	CASE	no bid	142.98 cs	no bid	198.00 cs	no bid	no bid	no bid	137.60 cs	149.90 cs	no bid
4.	45	m/case	NITRILE POWDERFREE GLOVES 5 MIL	NITRILE EXAMINATION GLOVES MEDIUM GLOVES 100 GLOVES/BOX 10 BOX/CASE	No item # provided with bid submission	CASE	no bid	142.98 cs	no bid	198.00 cs	no bid	no bid	no bid	137.60 cs	149.90 cs	no bid
5.	75	m/case	NITRILE POWDERFREE GLOVES 5 MIL	NITRILE EXAMINATION GLOVES LARGE GLOVES 100 GLOVES/BOX 10 BOX/CASE	No item # provided with bid submission	CASE	no bid	142.98 cs	no bid	198.00 cs	no bid	no bid	no bid	137.60 cs	149.90 cs	no bid
6.	75	m/case	NITRILE POWDERFREE GLOVES 5 MIL	NITRILE EXAMINATION GLOVES X-LARGE GLOVES 100 GLOVES/BOX 10 BOX/CASE	GLVNTNMDHDPF XL	CASE	no bid	142.98 cs	no bid	198.00 cs	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	149.90 cs	no bid



Rappahannock Regional Jail ITB NO. #2021-JS <b>BID TAB</b>							TSRC, Inc.	Abel Industries, Inc.	Brame Specialty Company	Interboro Packaging Corp	Calico Packaging, LLC	ZEP Home Office-Admin	Central Poly-Bag Corp	Global Chi Supply Solution, LLC	Pyramid Paper Company	Loyal Hygiene Service
GLOVES CATEGORY																
	Estimated Annual Quantity	Unit	Item	Specifics	AWARDED Item Code	Price										
13.	45	m/case	NITRILE POWDERFREE GLOVES 3.5MIL	NITRILE EXAMINATION GLOVES SMALL GLOVES 100 GLOVES/BOX 10 BOX/CASE	HOSPECO #GLN133F-SM	CASE	no bid	142.98 cs	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	139.90 cs	no bid
14.	45	m/case	NITRILE POWDERFREE GLOVES 3.5 MIL	NITRILE EXAMINATION GLOVES MEDIUM GLOVES 100 GLOVES/BOX 10 BOX/CASE	HOSPECO #GLN133F-MD	CASE	no bid	142.98 cs	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	139.90 cs	no bid
15.	75	m/case	NITRILE POWDERFREE GLOVES 3.5 MIL	NITRILE EXAMINATION GLOVES LARGE GLOVES 100 GLOVES/BOX 10 BOX/CASE	HOSPECO #GLN133F-LG	CASE	no bid	142.98 cs	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	139.90 cs	no bid
16.	75	m/case	NITRILE POWDERFREE GLOVES 3.5 MIL	NITRILE EXAMINATION GLOVES X-LARGE GLOVES 100 GLOVES/BOX 10 BOX/CASE	HOSPECO #GLN133F-XL	CASE	no bid	142.98 cs	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	139.90 cs	no bid
17	75	m/case	NITRILE POWDERFREE GLOVES 3.5 MIL	NITRILE EXAMINATION GLOVES XX-LARGE GLOVES 100 GLOVES/BOX 10 BOX/CASE	HOSPECO #GLN133F-XXL	CASE	no bid	182.98 cs	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	139.90 cs	no bid

Rappahannock Regional Jail ITB NO. #2021-JS

**BID TAB**

**BAGS & LINERS CATEGORY**

BAGS & LINERS CATEGORY							TSRC, Inc.	Abel Industries, Inc.	Brame Specialty Company	Interboro Packaging Corp	Calico Packaging, LLC	ZEP Home Office-Admin	Central Poly Bag Corp	Global Chi Supply Solution, LLC	Pyramid Paper Company	Loyal Hygiene Service
	Estimated Annual Quantity	Unit	Item	Specifics	AWARDED Item Code	Price										
1.	375	Case	36X60-RECYCLED 14M 55GL	55GL ROLL CLEAR TRASH LINERS 200/CS	LIN60HHD	CASE	31.91 cs	16.63 cs	24.00 cs	21.84 cs	21.94 cs	no bid	19.90 cs	no bid	no bid	26.13 cs
2.	75	Case	RL 24x33 10 MIC 12-16 Gallon	12-16 Gallon 20/50 Rolls 1000/case	8023	CASE	32.91 cs	35.02 cs	does not meet 10 MIC	33.82 cs	41.08	no bid	24.00 cs	29.84 cs	no bid	23.10 cs
										NOTE: Upon evaluation items marked "A" accepted for evaluation						



Rappahannock Regional Jail ITB NO. #2021-JS

**BID TAB**

**MISCELLANEOUS CATEGORY**

							TSRC, Inc.	Abel Industries, Inc.	Brame Specialty Company	Interboro Packaging Corp	Calico Packaging, LLC	ZEP Home Office-Admin	Central Poly-Bag Corp	Global Chi Supply Solution, I.I.C.	Pyramid Paper Company	Loyal Hygiene Service
	Estimated Annual Quantity	Unit	Item	Specifics	AWARDED Item Code	Price										
1.	4	pl	TRACTION MELT ICEMELT 50/PAL		DRYICETRAC50	PALETTE	no bid	530.74 pal	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	1919.5	no bid	no bid
2.	24	Case	BLUE SHOP TOWELS	200 COUNT BOX 10" X 12" 6 BOXES/CASE	KCC75190	EACH	no bid	0.59	13.88	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	2.90	7.08	no bid
3.	24	Each	GRAY ROUND TRASH CAN	TOUGH GUY 32 GALLON ROUND TRASH CAN PLASTIC, GRAY WITH LID	7907177 CAN 7907178 LID	EACH	58.25 ea	33.69 ea	33.58 ea	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	97.42 ea	37.98 ea	no bid
4.	12	Each	AIR FRESHENER DISPENSER	RUBBERMAID METERED AIR FRESHENER DISPENSER 800 CU FT COVERAGE AEROSOL CANISTER REFILL TYPE, WHITE 5XL19	CHASE #1000	EACH	no bid	57.17 ea	27.00 ea	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	13.99 ea	no bid
5.	75	Each	RUBBERMAID AEROSOL FRESHENER	USED IN DISPENSERS ABOVE – SEBREEZE 3000	HOSPECO #07932	EACH	no bid	16.13 ea	4.78 ea	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	2.59 ea	no bid

Rappahannock Regional Jail ITB NO. #2021-JS

**BID TAB**

**PERSONAL HYGIENE CATEGORY**

PERSONAL HYGIENE CATEGORY							TSRC, Inc.	Abel Industries, Inc.	Brame Specialty Company	Interboro Packaging Corp	Calico Packaging, LLC	ZEP Home Office-Admin	Central Poly-Bag Corp	Global Chi Supply Solution, I.I.C.	Pyramid Paper Company	Loyal Hygiene Service
	Estimated Annual Quantity	Unit	Item	Specifics	AWARDED Item Code	Price										
1.	35	Case	PINK LOTION HANDSOAP 4/CS	4 GALLONS/CS	2018030	CASE	35.25 cs	24.98 cs	24.58 cs	no bid	no bid	43.00 cs	no bid	28.18 cs	33.98 cs	23.8
2.	475	Case	DIAL DEODORANT SOAP 2.5 OZ. WRAPPED BAR SOAP <b>NO SUBSTITUTIONS</b>	BAR SOAP 2.5 OZ 200/CS	7911904	CASE	no bid	54.18 cs	50.82 cs	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	substitution not accepted	59.95 cs	no bid
3.	1	Case	HAND SANITIZING GEL 5666	GEL 5666 - 12/CS	ZEP FUZION INSTANT HAND SANITIZER 124616 4 x 1200ML	CASE	45.20 cs	51.15 cs	61.96 cs	no bid	no bid	42.00 cs	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
4.	350	Case	MT-4 HOSPECO SANITARY NAPKIN <b>NO SUBSTITUTIONS</b>	250/CS	2230901	CASE	44.50 cs	28.27 cs	28.09 cs	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	40.55 cs	32.98 cs	no bid
5.	5	Case	WAXED SANITARY BAGS 9.75WX9.	(9.75WX9.875) 250/CS	SNPBAG6141	PER BAG	0.07	0.05	0.08	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	0.11	0.05	no bid
6.	10	Case	PINK LOTION SKIN CLEANSER	HEALTH GUARD PINK LOTION SKIN CLEANSER 800ML BAG-IN-BOX 12/CASE	HDPKPRL	CASE	no bid	24.83 cs	26.20 cs	no bid	no bid	43.00	no bid	35.28 cs	no bid	no bid
7.	12	Each	Dispenser for 800ML BAG- IN-BOX SKIN CLEANSER – SEE ABOVE	800ML BAG-IN-BOX LOTION SKIN CLEANSER DISPENSER	DISPNWHT	CASE	no bid	0	5.00 ea	no bid	no bid	13.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid

Note: Item 5 tie breaker vendor reduction for this category